

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

AWARD	(Multiple Items)					
CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
BRUSHES	BR001	1/4" easel brushes	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	102	0.09	\$ 9.18
	BR002	1/2" easel brushes	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	102	0.17	\$ 17.34
	BR003	Blick wonder white, round brush	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	0.56	\$ -
	BR004	Synthetic bristle brush assortment - short handles	NASCO	3	92.99	\$ 278.97
	BR005	Golden Nylon Round 72-Brush Assortment	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	74.49	\$ 446.94
	BR006	Bamboo Brush sz. 2	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	30	0.61	\$ 18.30
	BR007	Bamboo Brush sz. 4	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	30	1.05	\$ 31.50
	BR008	Bamboo Brush sz. 6	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	30	1.3	\$ 39.00
	BR009	Taklon brushes	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	31.6	\$ 63.20
	BR010	Scholastic Wonder White Brush	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	100	0.8	\$ 80.00
	BR011	Scholastic Wonder White Brush	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	100	1.4	\$ 140.00
	BR012	Soft grip round brush assortment	NASCO	3	82.82	\$ 248.46
	BR013	Blick Wonder White, round short handle	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	62	1.8	\$ 111.60
	BR014	Scholastic Wonder White Brush	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	25	0.69	\$ 17.25
	BR015	Scholastic Wonder White Brush	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	25	1.34	\$ 33.50
	BR016	Blick Scholastic Wonder White	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	50	1.26	\$ 63.00
	BR017	Blick Scholastic Wonder White	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	50	1.09	\$ 54.50
	BR018	Dynasty White Taklon Canister Assortments	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	3	81.36	\$ 244.08
	BR019	Dynasty Fine White Synthetic	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	152.57	\$ 610.28
	BR020	Dynasty Bright Gold Nylon Acrylic Brush Canister	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	82.06	\$ 82.06
BR021	Dynasty Bright Gold Nylon Acrylic Brush Canister	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	82.06	\$ 82.06	
BR022	Wyland Whale Tail Art Brushes	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	9.73	\$ -	
CERAMICS	CE001	PORTLAND POTTERY WHITE clay	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	15	\$ -
	CE002	Sheffield Pottery clay	PORTLAND POTTERY	26	15	\$ 390.00
	CE003	Clay 50 lb white	PORTLAND POTTERY	60	15	\$ 900.00
	CE004	Clay 50 lb terracotta	PORTLAND POTTERY	24	17	\$ 408.00
	CE005	Red clay with grog	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	18	\$ -
	CE006	Replacement Sponge for Blick B32925-0000 sponge holder	PORTLAND POTTERY	20	0.42	\$ 8.40
	CE007	Skutt Peephole plugs	NASCO	2	3.29	\$ 6.58
	CE008	Amaco small "junior" pyrometric cones, Cone 05	NASCO	0	5.18	\$ -
	CE009	AMACO VELVET UNDERGLAZE PINT	NO BID	0	See attached	
	CE010	SS 201 Tulip Red Lead free sunstrokes underglaze PINT	NO BID	4	(blank)	
	CE011	Amaco semi-moist underglaze sets	CASCADE	0	17.48	\$ -
	CE012	Amaco underglaze decorating chalk crayons	CASCADE	0	19.31	\$ -
	CE013	Opalescent glazes 20 Blue Bell, pint	CASCADE	6	8.57	\$ 51.42
	CE014	Mini Ribbon Sculpting Set	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	8	2.4	\$ 19.20
	CE015	Wire clay cutter	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	25	0.39	\$ 9.75
	CE016	Hard fettling knife	NASCO	10	1.29	\$ 12.90
	CE017	Pro needle tool	NASCO	60	1.03	\$ 61.80
	CE018	3-3/4" Toothed Scraper	NASCO	6	0.53	\$ 3.18

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
CERAMICS	CE019	Sculpture wire gauge 14	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	16	6.61	\$ 105.76
	CE020	Sculpture wire gauge 12	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	14	16.15	\$ 226.10
	CE021	galvanized wire gauge 18	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	18	2.62	\$ 47.16
	CE022	Clay Thickness Strips box of 8	NASCO	0	9.11	\$ -
	CE023	10" Wooden Rolling Pin	NASCO	8	4.5	\$ 36.00
	CE024	Steel point stilts	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	8	8.07	\$ 64.56
	CE025	Kiln Shelf Wash	KURTZ BROTHERS	2	6.32	\$ 12.64
	CE026	Suspendaid	NASCO	3	5.44	\$ 16.32
	CE027	Amaco O-52 Fuchsia	CASCADE	6	8.53	\$ 51.18
	CE028	Amaco O-42 Moss Green	CASCADE	2	8.62	\$ 17.24
	CE029	Amaco O-30 Autumn Leaf	CASCADE	3	8.6	\$ 25.80
	CE030	Amaco A-28 Peacock	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	6.43	\$ 12.86
	CE031	Amaco A-66 Burnt Orange	NASCO	3	6.85	\$ 20.55
	CE032	Amaco LT-15 Speckled Blue-Gray	CASCADE	3	8.39	\$ 25.17
	CE033	Amaco LT-16 Green Stone	CASCADE	2	8.12	\$ 16.24
	CE034	Amaco LT-132 Jewel Brown	CASCADE	4	8.25	\$ 33.00
	CE035	Amaco LT-161 Tiger Eye HIGH FIRE	CASCADE	4	11.28	\$ 45.12
	CE036	HIGH FIRE	PORTLAND POTTERY	6	7.25	\$ 43.50
	CE037	Amaco PC-55 Chun Plum	CASCADE	6	7.88	\$ 47.28
	CE038	Amaco PC-32 Albany Slip Brown	CASCADE	2	8.23	\$ 16.46
	CE039	Amaco F-55 Pink	CASCADE	5	8.96	\$ 44.80
	CE040	Amaco CTL-15 Moonscape	CASCADE	3	10.75	\$ 32.25
	CE041	Amaco CTL-22 Milky Way	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	12	\$ 24.00
	CE042	Amaco CTL-11 Snow Fire	CASCADE	4	10.67	\$ 42.68
	CE043	Amaco CTL-36 Gingerbread	CASCADE	6	12.84	\$ 77.04
	CE044	Kiln Shelf - Skutt	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	16	\$ -
	CE045	AMACO Kiln Shelf 26" x 13" half octagon	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	23	\$ -
	CE046	AMACO Kiln Shelf 19" x 9 1/2"	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	20	\$ -
	CE047	AMACO kiln shelf supports 1" x 1" x 2"	NASCO	0	1.06	\$ -
	CE048	AMACO kiln shelf supports 1" x 1" x 6"	NASCO	0	1.38	\$ -
	CE049	AMACO kiln shelf supports 1" x 1" x 8"	NASCO	0	1.73	\$ -
	CE050	Amaco Engobe red brown	CASCADE	2	7.22	\$ 14.44
	CE051	Amaco Engobe dark blue	CASCADE	2	9.86	\$ 19.72
	CE052	Amaco Engobe Yellow	CASCADE	2	7.22	\$ 14.44
	CE053	Amaco Engobe Dark green	CASCADE	2	7.22	\$ 14.44
	CE054	Amaco Engobe White	CASCADE	2	6.94	\$ 13.88
	CE055	Amaco Engobe Black	CASCADE	2	9.95	\$ 19.90
	CE056	Austin Healthmate Replacement Filter with Pre-Filter White	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	CE057	Amaco LG-42 Light Green, pint	CASCADE	6	8.9	\$ 53.40
	CE058	Amaco LG-24 Light Blue, pint	CASCADE	5	8.9	\$ 44.50
	CE059	12 Pt Class Pack Amaco Velvet Underglaze	KURTZ BROTHERS	5	31.22	\$ 156.10
	CE060	Amaco V-360 White Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	10.78	\$ 43.12
	CE061	Amaco V-361 Jet Black Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	10.78	\$ 43.12
CE062	Amaco V-387 Bright Red Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	23.93	\$ 95.72	
CE063	Amaco V-316 Lite Pink Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	11.36	\$ 22.72	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
CERAMICS	CE064	Amaco V-308 Yellow Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE065	Amaco V-309 Deep Yellow Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE066	Amaco V 384 Real Orange Velvet underglaze, pint	NASCO	0	24.7	\$ -
	CE067	Amaco V-326 Medium Blue Velvet underglaze, pint	NASCO	0	11.13	\$ -
	CE068	Amaco V-332 Teal Blue Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE069	Amaco V-327 Turquoise Blue Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE070	Amaco V-325 Baby Blue Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE071	Amaco V-341 Blue Green Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	11.36	\$ 22.72
	CE072	Amaco V-322 Purple Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	1	11.36	\$ 11.36
	CE073	Amaco V-353 Dark Green Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE074	Amaco V-343 Chartreuse Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE075	Amaco V-366 Teddy Bear Brown Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE076	Amaco V-314 Chocolate Brown Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE077	Amaco V-313 Red Brown Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	10.78	\$ 21.56
	CE078	Amaco V-321 Rose Velvet underglaze, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	11.36	\$ 45.44
	CE079	Rockin Red underglaze, (GARE brand)	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	10	\$ 20.00
	CE080	Lug #15 - Warm Grey Lead Free underglaze, pint	CASCADE	2	13.25	\$ 26.50
	CE081	Lug #50 - Pink Lead Free underglaze, pint	CASCADE	1	13.25	\$ 13.25
	CE082	Lug #21 - Medium Blue Lead Free underglaze, pint	CASCADE	1	13.44	\$ 13.44
	CE083	Lug #41- Irish Green Lead Free underglaze, pint	CASCADE	2	13.33	\$ 26.66
	CE084	Lug #53 - Suntan Lead Free underglaze, pint	CASCADE	0	13.05	\$ -
	CE085	Gloss glaze: Black Magic, pint	CASCADE	3	9.24	\$ 27.72
	CE086	Gloss glaze: Canary yellow, pint	CASCADE	9	8.9	\$ 80.10
	CE087	Gloss glaze: Vivid orange, pint	CASCADE	9	12.04	\$ 108.36
	CE088	Gloss glaze: Dark blue, pint	CASCADE	9	10.36	\$ 93.24
	CE089	Gloss glaze: Leaf green, pint	CASCADE	8	8.9	\$ 71.20
	CE090	Gloss glaze: Chocolate brown, pint	CASCADE	8	9.24	\$ 73.92
	CE091	Textured Glaze: 3 Old Pewter, pint	CASCADE	4	10.61	\$ 42.44
	CE092	Opalescent glaze: 20 Blue Bell, pint	CASCADE	0	8.57	\$ -
	CE093	Opalescent glaze: 23 sapphire blue, pint	CASCADE	2	8.6	\$ 17.20

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
CERAMICS	CE094	Crystaltex Glaze: CTL-41 Melon	CASCADE	3	10.68	\$ 32.04
	CE095	Crystaltex Glaze: CTL-67 Summer Mango	CASCADE	4	12.69	\$ 50.76
	CE096	Crystaltex glaze: Fu Manchu, pint	CASCADE	6	10.58	\$ 63.48
	CE097	Crystaltex glaze: mardi gras, pint	CASCADE	4	10.68	\$ 42.72
	CE098	Crystaltex glaze: Fantasia, pint	CASCADE	4	10.75	\$ 43.00
	CE099	No. 10 LG10 Clear Transparent Glaze, gallon	CASCADE	11	26.6	\$ 292.60
	CE100	Transparent Matte Glaze, pint	NASCO	1	8.93	\$ 8.93
	CE101	High fire glaze: clear glaze, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	6	7.5	\$ 45.00
	CE102	High fire glaze: Sahara Black, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	8.25	\$ -
	CE103	High Fire glaze: Red Gloss, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	15.5	\$ 31.00
	CE104	High fire glaze: Gloss Burgundy, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	10.5	\$ -
	CE105	High fire glaze: Yellow, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	8.5	\$ -
	CE106	High fire glaze: Coral matt, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	15.5	\$ -
	CE107	High fire glaze: Teal Blue, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	8	\$ 16.00
	CE108	High Fire glaze: brown, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	8	\$ -
	CE109	High Fire Glaze: textured Amber, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	7.5	\$ 15.00
	CE110	No.25 white clay, 50-lb carton	CASCADE	2012	17.61	\$ 35,431.32
	CE111	10T white earthenware	PORTLAND POTTERY	0	16.5	\$ -
	CE112	20 Terra Cotta earthenware	PORTLAND POTTERY	1000	17	\$ 17,000.00
	CE113	50 Tan Stoneware w/ manganese	PORTLAND POTTERY	1600	17	\$ 27,200.00
	CE114	16 Grolleg Porcelain	PORTLAND POTTERY	1000	5.25	\$ 5,250.00
	CE115	Marx Aztec High-Fire mender	NO BID	24	(blank)	
	CE116	Lead-free Arroya glaze, white, 4-oz jar	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	CE117	Laguna Moroccan sand lead-free stoneware glaze, robin's egg, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	7.25	\$ 29.00
	CE118	Amaco celebration high fire glazes	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	CE119	Teal Amaco celebration high fire glaze, pint	CASCADE	2	6.94	\$ 13.88
	CE120	Amethyst Amaco celebration high fire glaze, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	15.5	\$ 31.00
	CE121	Chartreuse Amaco celebration high fire glaze, pint	CASCADE	0	10.06	\$ -
	CE122	Amaco celebration high fire glaze HF-140 green	CASCADE	0	6.85	\$ -
CE123	Amaco celebration high fire glaze HF-16 Orangerie	NO BID	0	(blank)		
CE124	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, frosted melon, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	8	6.52	\$ 52.16	
CE125	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Indigo PC_23, pint	CASCADE	2	6.27	\$ 12.54	
CE126	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Deep Olive Speckle, pint	CASCADE	2	6.33	\$ 12.66	
CE127	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Iron Lustre, pint	CASCADE	0	6.33	\$ -	
CE128	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Umber Float, pint	CASCADE	2	6.16	\$ 12.32	
CE129	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Shino, pint	CASCADE	1	6.33	\$ 6.33	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
CERAMICS	CE130	Amaco Sahara High-Fire Glazes, white Matt pint	CASCADE	3	6.38	\$ 19.14
	CE131	Amaco Magic Flow White Glaze, pint	NO BID	3	(blank)	
	CE132	AMACO Wax Resist	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	8	\$ 32.00
	CE133	Amaco lead-free waxy white glaze, pint	CASCADE	4	8.3	\$ 33.20
	CE134	Amaco lead-free matte glaze, blue-green, pint	CASCADE	4	8.4	\$ 33.60
	CE135	Amaco F Series glazes, navy, pint	CASCADE	4	8.53	\$ 34.12
	CE136	Mason stain #6616 chrome-free gray	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	CE137	Mason stain #6306 vivid blue	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	CE138	Mason stain #6069 dark coral	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	CE139	Michael Sherrill "gummy ribs"	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	6	\$ 24.00
	CE140	Kiln shelf and posts for SKUTT model KM 1227 - octagonal	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	CE141	AMACO "Teacher's Palette" line of mixable Cone 05 Glazes	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	1	87.63	\$ 87.63
	CE142	Non-Toxic Underglaze Set	NASCO	4	31.25	\$ 125.00
	CE143	True Flow Lead-Free Non-Toxic Gloss Glaze sets	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	9	16.95	\$ 152.55
	CE144	Amaco Underglaze Pencil - Black	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	5.58	\$ 55.80
	CE145	Amaco Opalescent glazes Class Pack Pint	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	55.6	\$ -
	CE146	Kemper Hole Cutters 3/16"	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	1.8	\$ 7.20
	CE147	Kemper Hole Cutters 1/4"	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	1.9	\$ 7.60
	CE148	Kemper Hole Cutters 1/2"	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	2.3	\$ 9.20
	CE149	Laguna PACIFICA SPLASH PAN	PORTLAND POTTERY	4	42	\$ 168.00
	CE150	Corelite by Cedar Heights Kiln Shelf	NO BID	1	(blank)	
	CE151	Corelite by Cedar Heights Kiln Shelf	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	CE152	Corelite by Cedar Heights Kiln Shelf	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	CE153	Corelite by Cedar Heights Kiln Shelf	NO BID	1	(blank)	
	CE154	Corelite by Cedar Heights Kiln Shelf	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	CE155	Corelite by Cedar Heights Kiln Shelf	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	CE156	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-11 Opaque White	CASCADE	2	8.06	\$ 16.12
	CE157	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-14 Gray	CASCADE	1	8.87	\$ 8.87
	CE158	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-25 Turquoise Green	CASCADE	1	8.87	\$ 8.87
	CE159	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-30 Chocolate Brown	CASCADE	2	9.24	\$ 18.48
	CE160	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-48 Chrome Green	CASCADE	2	8.88	\$ 17.76
	CE161	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-68 Vivid Orange	CASCADE	2	12.04	\$ 24.08
	CE162	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-52 Petal Pink	CASCADE	1	8.9	\$ 8.90
	CE163	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-58 Brilliant Red	CASCADE	2	12.04	\$ 24.08
CE164	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-61 Canary Yellow	CASCADE	2	8.9	\$ 17.80	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE	
CERAMICS	CE165	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-01 True Black	CASCADE	2	9.24	\$ 18.48	
	CE166	Amaco Lead-Free LG Gloss Glaze Pint LG-56 Christmas Red	NO BID	4	(blank)		
	CE167	AA-24 EXOTIC BLUE LEAD FREE AMACO GLAZE	NASCO	4	6.85	\$ 27.40	
	CE168	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Blue Midnight, pint	CASCADE	4	6.27	\$ 25.08	
	CE169	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Oatmeal, pint	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	5.77	\$ 23.08	
	CE170	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Seaweed, pint	CASCADE	2	6.22	\$ 12.44	
	CE171	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Ancient Jasper, pint	CASCADE	6	6.33	\$ 37.98	
	CE172	Amaco Potter's choice glaze, Smokey Merlot, pint	PORTLAND POTTERY	2	7.5	\$ 15.00	
	CE173	Amaco Celadon glaze, C-21 Sky, pint	NASCO	2	6.79	\$ 13.58	
	CE174	Amaco Celadon glaze, C-49 Rainforest, pint	NASCO	2	6.79	\$ 13.58	
	CE175	SHERRILL MUDTOOLS : POTTERS RIB: VERY SOFT RED RIB R2	PORTLAND POTTERY	8	6	\$ 48.00	
	CE176	SHERRILL MUDTOOLS : POTTERS RIB: VERY SOFT RED RIB R5	PORTLAND POTTERY	8	6	\$ 48.00	
	CE177	METAL RIB WITH TEETH	NASCO	12	0.53	\$ 6.36	
	CE178	AMACO LUG, 2-OZ JAR PINK	CASCADE	4	3.34	\$ 13.36	
	CE179	Self Hardening Sculpture Clay	CASCADE	8	3.38	\$ 27.04	
	DRAWING MATERIALS	DM001	Sakura Pigma Micron Pen (.03)	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	725	1.21	\$ 877.25
		DM002	Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	180	0.86	\$ 154.80
		DM003	Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	86	0.86	\$ 73.96
		DM004	Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00
DM005		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM006		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM007		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM008		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM009		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM010		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	62	0.86	\$ 53.32	
DM011		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	62	0.86	\$ 53.32	
DM012		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	86	0.86	\$ 73.96	
DM013		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	98	0.86	\$ 84.28	
DM014		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	62	0.86	\$ 53.32	
DM015		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM016		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM017		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	62	0.86	\$ 53.32	
DM018		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	62	0.86	\$ 53.32	
DM019		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM020		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM021		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM022		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM023		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.86	\$ 43.00	
DM024		Colored Pencil Prismacolor	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	80	0.86	\$ 68.80	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
DRAWING	DM025	Prismacolor Premier colored pencils	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	67	28.27	\$ 1,894.09
	DM026	Drawing Pencil : 6B	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	500	0.12	\$ 60.00
	DM027	Drawing Pencil : 4B	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	500	0.12	\$ 60.00
	DM028	Drawing Pencil : 2B	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	600	0.11	\$ 66.00
	DM029	Drawing Pencil : HB	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	500	0.11	\$ 55.00
	DM030	Graphite pencils (school pack)	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	11	73.22	\$ 805.42
	DM031	Graphite pencils	NASCO	8	0.95	\$ 7.60
	DM032	#2 pencils	CASCADE	0	0.75	\$ -
	DM033	#2 pencils	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	99	1.22	\$ 120.78
	DM034	Ultra fine point marker	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	1264	0.45	\$ 568.80
	DM035	Mr. Sketch Unscented markers/classpack	KURTZ BROTHERS	14	80.89	\$ 1,132.46
	DM036	Fine Point Marker Set 29 Color	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	32	12.45	\$ 398.40
	DM037	Super marker	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	25	0.82	\$ 20.50
	DM038	Super marker	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	555	0.48	\$ 266.40
	DM039	Ebony pencils	CASCADE	0	3.96	\$ -
	DM040	Vine charcoal - yarka	NASCO	10	6.41	\$ 64.10
	DM041	8 color overwriter markers	NO BID	26	(blank)	
	DM042	Gel washable markers	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	36	2.58	\$ 92.88
	DM043	Metallic color pencil sets, 8 pencils	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	40	1.64	\$ 65.60
	DM044	160 piece construction paper crayons, large size	CASCADE	14	26.57	\$ 371.98
	DM045	Colored pencils	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	12	1.27	\$ 15.24
	DM046	Unscented markers classpack	KURTZ BROTHERS	4	80.89	\$ 323.56
	DM047	Fiddlesticks markers classpack	CASCADE	1	48.69	\$ 48.69
	DM048	Crayola 256 broad marker classpack	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	3	44.8	\$ 134.40
	DM049	400 piece Crayola construction paper crayons classpack 16 color	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	2	27	\$ 54.00
	DM050	Colored pencil 12-color set	S&S WORLDWIDE	1	1.2	\$ 1.20
	DM051	Micro Ultra Fine Point set of markers 12 Assorted colors	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	36	6.5	\$ 234.00
	DM052	Vine charcoal medium	NASCO	0	4.64	\$ -
	DM053	GENERAL CHARCOAL PENCIL 2B	KURTZ BROTHERS	24	0.6	\$ 14.40
	DM054	Chisel Tip marker - black	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	100	0.12	\$ 12.00
	DM055	X-Acto 1800 Electric Sharpener	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	12	10.47	\$ 125.64
	DM056	Canister pencil sharpeners	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	29	0.11	\$ 3.19
	DM057	Crayon sharpener	CASCADE	0	35.13	\$ -
	DM058	Papermate pink pearl erasers 12/box	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	42	0.57	\$ 23.94
	DM059	Kneaded Rubber Erasers	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	75	0.12	\$ 9.00
	DM060	gum erasers (box) large	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	7	2.95	\$ 20.65
	DM061	gum erasers (box) small	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	7	2.78	\$ 19.46
	DM062	Factis erasers	NASCO	13	0.55	\$ 7.15
	DM063	soap erasers - box of 24 (small size)	NASCO	0	2.81	\$ -
	DM064	Eraser Refills	CASCADE	100	0.59	\$ 59.00
	DM065	Eraser Sticks	NASCO	145	0.96	\$ 139.20
DM066	Staedtler Mars White Plastic Eraser	NASCO	14	1.3	\$ 18.20	
DM067	Soft block erasers - small	KURTZ BROTHERS	6	1.19	\$ 7.14	
DM068	Prismacolor Pencil Sharpener	KURTZ BROTHERS	6	1.18	\$ 7.08	
DM069	Oil pastels set of 28 colors	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	68	2.24	\$ 152.32	
DM070	Nupastels 24 color sticks	CASCADE	50	17.18	\$ 859.00	
DM071	Plaster cloth	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	11	30.71	\$ 337.81	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
DRAWING	DM072	Craypas white	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	36	1.45	\$ 52.20
	DM073	Craypas Black	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	1.45	\$ 14.50
	DM074	Super Black Waterproof India Ink	NASCO	0	7.73	\$ -
	DM075	Tortillon set	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	13	1.5	\$ 19.50
	DM076	Crayola multicultural classpack marker	CASCADE	25	23.14	\$ 578.50
	DM077	Crayola	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	32	1.21	\$ 38.72
	DM078	Crayola	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	32	1.21	\$ 38.72
	DM079	Crayola	CASCADE	44	0.53	\$ 23.32
	DM080	Sakura Cray Pas Junior Artist	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	61	1.06	\$ 64.66
	DM081	Sakura Cray Pas Junior Srtists	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	4.85	\$ -
	DM082	Sharpie Fine Point Marker	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	755	0.45	\$ 339.75
	DM083	Sharpie Medium Point Marker	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	481	0.45	\$ 216.45
	DM084	Metallic silver sharpie	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	127	0.85	\$ 107.95
	DM085	Crow Quill Dip Pen, individual Nib, #102	CASCADE	100	8.27	\$ 827.00
	DM086	Crow Quill Dep Pen Holder, #102	NASCO	50	0.66	\$ 33.00
	DM087	Charcoal pencils	NASCO	136	0.61	\$ 82.96
	DM088	White charcoal pencils	NASCO	99	0.61	\$ 60.39
	DM089	White tag board heavy weight	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	11	2.37	\$ 26.07
	DM090	Block Erasers, Small, Pink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	1.73	\$ 8.65
	DM091	DRAWING PENCIL: 2H	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	134	1.08	\$ 144.72
	DM092	CHARCOAL PENCIL 4 B SOFT	CASCADE	0	6.75	\$ -
	DM093	Chunk-O Crayons	NASCO	3	5.78	\$ 17.34
	DM094	General's Compressed Pastel Chalk	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	15	2.18	\$ 32.70
	DM095	Prismacolor kneaded rubber eraser	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	100	0.38	\$ 38.00
	DM096	Prismacolor Premier Verithin colored pencils	CASCADE	28	5.75	\$ 161.00
	DM097	Sketcher Non-Photo Blue Pencil	CASCADE	10	9.67	\$ 96.70
	DM098	General Pink Erasers	NASCO	2	32.51	\$ 65.02
	DM099	Opal Glitter	NASCO	6	4.58	\$ 27.48
	DM100	Assorted Color Glitter	NASCO	6	4.58	\$ 27.48
	DM101	Glitter Markers	NASCO	10	4.11	\$ 41.10
	DM102	Glitter Crayons	NASCO	10	1.49	\$ 14.90
	GENERAL ART SUPPLIES, MISC.	GA001	Hardwood manikin 12"	NASCO	14	3.26
GA002		Cellulose sponges	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	74	1.51	\$ 111.74
GA003		Miracle sponges	NASCO	15	5.78	\$ 86.70
GA004		Magnet Man 4 pkg	CASCADE	9	0.74	\$ 6.66
GA005		Lids medium pkg 125	NASCO	7	3.05	\$ 21.35
GA006		Cups medium	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	9	2.73	\$ 24.57
GA007		Aluminum foil 500 ft rolls	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	14	24.09	\$ 337.26
GA008		Transparency film	KURTZ BROTHERS	1	3.9	\$ 3.90
GA009		Velcro adhesive back	CASCADE	2	11.34	\$ 22.68
GA010		Velcro tape roll - white	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	11.17	\$ 44.68
GA011		Velcro dot roll - white	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	4.24	\$ 21.20
GA012		Safe-T-compass	NASCO	60	0.6	\$ 36.00
GA013		Sequins & spangles	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	5.7	\$ 28.50
GA014		Bright buttons	S&S WORLDWIDE	5	4.16	\$ 20.80
GA015		Craft buttons	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	9	2.05	\$ 18.45
GA016		Bead assortment	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	3	3.53	\$ 10.59
GA017		Hemp twine - black	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	1	2.68	\$ 2.68
GA018		Bright color yarn in dispenser box	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	71.29	\$ 142.58

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
GENERAL ART	GA019	Jumbo roving yarn pack	S&S WORLDWIDE	4	49.58	\$ 198.32
	GA020	Yarn, skein	S&S WORLDWIDE	11	1.49	\$ 16.39
	GA021	Yarn, skein	S&S WORLDWIDE	11	1.49	\$ 16.39
	GA022	Yarn, skein	S&S WORLDWIDE	11	1.49	\$ 16.39
	GA023	Yarn, skein	S&S WORLDWIDE	11	1.49	\$ 16.39
	GA024	Yarn, skein	NASCO	9	1.72	\$ 15.48
	GA025	Yarn, skein	S&S WORLDWIDE	12	1.49	\$ 17.88
	GA026	Yarn, skein	S&S WORLDWIDE	12	1.49	\$ 17.88
	GA027	Kelly green burlap	NASCO	4	2.02	\$ 8.08
	GA028	Ecliptic blue burlap	NASCO	4	2.02	\$ 8.08
	GA029	China red burlap	NASCO	4	2.02	\$ 8.08
	GA030	6" plastic weaving needle,	NASCO	0	1.11	\$ -
	GA031	#13 blunt tapestry needle	NASCO	2	2.46	\$ 4.92
	GA032	#18 blunt tapestry needle	CASCADE	0	1.36	\$ -
	GA033	Weaving needles 12pack	NASCO	0	1.11	\$ -
	GA034	Felt assorted pack	S&S WORLDWIDE	28	1.83	\$ 51.24
	GA035	Tooling foil - coppertone	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	16	4.13	\$ 66.08
	GA036	Brass color foil	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	4.13	\$ 16.52
	GA037	Acrylic gems	S&S WORLDWIDE	9	2.79	\$ 25.11
	GA038	Jumbo chenille Kraft stems	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	14	0.64	\$ 8.96
	GA039	Rainbow assortment feathers	S&S WORLDWIDE	4	0.64	\$ 2.56
	GA040	Wiggle eyes	S&S WORLDWIDE	4	0.53	\$ 2.12
	GA041	Twisteez colored wire	KURTZ BROTHERS	14	21.58	\$ 302.12
	GA042	Uncoated paper plates	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	1.37	\$ 6.85
	GA043	White model magic 2 lb.	CASCADE	22	12.76	\$ 280.72
	GA044	Assorted color model magic 2 lb.	CASCADE	6	12.86	\$ 77.16
	GA045	Natural color model magic 2 lb.	CASCADE	4	12.33	\$ 49.32
	GA046	Neon color model magic 2 lb.	CASCADE	0	12.33	\$ -
	GA047	20 lb. Bag instant paper mache	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	1	38.05	\$ 38.05
	GA048	Plaster of Paris 25-lb box	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	1	3.63	\$ 3.63
	GA049	20x30" foam core	CASCADE	3	8.92	\$ 26.76
	GA050	Small nitrile disposable gloves	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	4.41	\$ 17.64
	GA051	Small nitrile gloves	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	33	2.04	\$ 67.32
	GA052	Large nitrile gloves	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	2.04	\$ -
	GA053	Blick large Bone Folder	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	12	3.93	\$ 47.16
	GA054	Double-sided mirror	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	12	4.49	\$ 53.88
	GA055	Single-sided mirror	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	20	4.1	\$ 82.00
	GA056	Kemper Wood Model Tool - JA 4	CHESAPEAKE	12	1.69	\$ 20.28
	GA057	Aluminum Rulers 12"	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	42	0.57	\$ 23.94
	GA058	Aluminum Rulers 18"	KURTZ BROTHERS	10	1.16	\$ 11.60
	GA059	Aluminum Rulers 24"	KURTZ BROTHERS	38	1.15	\$ 43.70
	GA060	Sequins	NASCO	0	0.35	\$ -
	GA061	Blick Waxed Linen Cord, Brown	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	2	9.39	\$ 18.78
	GA062	Blick Waxed Linen Cord, Natural	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	9.39	\$ 9.39
	GA063	1/4" coiling core	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	7.84	\$ 54.88
	GA064	Wooden Dowel Rods	NASCO	1	3.26	\$ 3.26
	GA065	T-pins	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	22	0.67	\$ 14.74
	GA066	Craft sticks	S&S WORLDWIDE	2	2.68	\$ 5.36
	GA067	Colored craft sticks - regular	S&S WORLDWIDE	1	4.66	\$ 4.66
	GA068	Colored craft sticks - jumbo	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	8	5.06	\$ 40.48
	GA069	Feathers plumage white	NO BID	5	(blank)	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
GENERAL ART	GA070	Feathers plumage black	NO BID	6	(blank)	
	GA071	Feathers plumage red	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	GA072	Feathers plumage pink	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	GA073	Feathers plumage yellow	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	GA074	Feathers plumage blue	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	GA075	Feathers plumage bronze brown	NO BID	3	(blank)	
	GA076	Natural feather assortment 1/2 oz	S&S WORLDWIDE	11	0.65	\$ 7.15
	GA077	Craft and party bags	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	15.16	\$ 60.64
	GA078	Terra Cotta tile grout	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	GA079	White tile grout	NASCO	4	4.01	\$ 16.04
	GA080	Black tile grout	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	GA081	Mosaic primary glass	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	4.49	\$ 22.45
	GA082	Mosaic glass squiggles	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	4.58	\$ 18.32
	GA083	Iridescent film roll	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	7.43	\$ 7.43
	GA084	Cardboard circles	NASCO	3	12.24	\$ 36.72
	GA085	Safety goggles	CASCADE	0	2.48	\$ -
	GA086	Medium disposable gloves	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	0.59	\$ -
	GA087	Large disposable gloves	KURTZ BROTHERS	1	0.62	\$ 0.62
	GA088	Craft Plier Set (5/set)	NASCO	6	7.26	\$ 43.56
	GA089	Aluminum Rulers 24"	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	1.15	\$ -
	GA090	3"x 7" paper mache cones	NASCO	100	0.58	\$ 58.00
	GA091	Trait-Tex standard wt. bright 9 cone yarn ass.	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	71.29	\$ 142.58
	GA092	Trait-Tex JUMBO wt. bright 9 cone yarn ass.	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	3	68.65	\$ 205.95
	GA093	Jumbo Tongue Blades box of 500	CASCADE	2	4.9	\$ 9.80
	GA094	Giant pompom Assortment	NASCO	1	7.05	\$ 7.05
	GA095	Roylco Straws & Connectors Set	NASCO	2	11.25	\$ 22.50
	GA096	Paca Fluff Wool Roving	NASCO	3	9.38	\$ 28.14
	GA097	Wide notch chipboard student weaving looms	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	1.58	\$ 15.80
	GA098	Nitrile Powder Free Disposable Gloves	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	4.41	\$ 22.05
	GA099	Nitrile Powder Free Disposable Gloves	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	4.41	\$ 8.82
	GA100	Jumbo Craft Sticks	S&S WORLDWIDE	0	4.06	\$ -
	GA101	Plastic Animation Pegbar	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	40	3.19	\$ 127.60
	GA102	BUR LIFE (LUBRICANT)	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	GA104	SHEET COPPER 18GA 6"X12"	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	GA105	Cellulose Sponges # 4300344	NASCO	36	0.71	\$ 25.56
	GA106	Sponges with scrubby side	CASCADE	132	2	\$ 264.00
	GA107	CLOTH,&POLISHING, ROUGE CLOTH 9 X 11	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	GA108	Blick AWT DRYING RACK # 51308-1006	NASCO	0	246.41	\$ -
	GA109	Blick E-Z Cut blocks	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	75	1.18	\$ 88.50
	GA110	Twisteez Bendy Wire	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	6.14	\$ -
GA111	Hair Dryer	NASCO	(blank)	36.67	\$ -	
GA112	Executive Function Clock	NO BID	(blank)	(blank)		
GA113	Highland, Transparency Film for copiers w/o sensing stripe	NO BID	(blank)	(blank)		
GLUE, PASTE, TAPE, FASTENERS, TAPE DISPENSERS	GL001	Hot melt 4" glue sticks	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	2.94	\$ 29.40

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
GLUE, PASTE,	GL002	Hot Glue Stix - mini	NASCO	3	3.95	\$ 11.85
	GL003	Hot Glue Stix - 4"	S&S WORLDWIDE	4	1.32	\$ 5.28
	GL004	Glue sticks	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	51	2.69	\$ 137.19
	GL005	Elmers All Purpose Glue Sticks	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	178	0.61	\$ 108.58
	GL006	Elmers Glue-All	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	50	0.74	\$ 37.00
	GL007	Elmers Washable School Glue Sticks	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	166	0.25	\$ 41.50
	GL008	Elmers Washable School Glue Sticks	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	0	0.64	\$ -
	GL009	Elmers Washable School Glue Sticks	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	3	8.28	\$ 24.84
	GL010	ELMERS Glue	CASCADE	10	9.08	\$ 90.80
	GL011	Masking Tape 3/4"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	60	1.73	\$ 103.80
	GL012	3M Tartan Masking Tape -Roll	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	134	0.96	\$ 128.64
	GL013	Masking Tape 3/4"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	27	1.73	\$ 46.71
	GL014	1" roll of masking tape	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	260	0.71	\$ 184.60
	GL015	Masking tape 3/4 x 60	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	82	0.52	\$ 42.64
	GL016	Packing tape	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	16	0.42	\$ 6.72
	GL017	Scotch brand economy artist tape	NO BID	31	(blank)	
	GL018	Rubber cement 4 oz. metal can with brush	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	1.18	\$ -
	GL019	Sobo craft glue	NASCO	31	2.39	\$ 74.09
	GL020	Carpenter's wood glue - one quart	CASCADE	1	2.99	\$ 2.99
	GL021	Duco household cement 1-oz tube	NASCO	6	1.68	\$ 10.08
	GL022	Tombow mono adhesive dispenser refill	NO BID	12	(blank)	
	GL023	Tombow monoadhesive roller (not refill)	NO BID	12	(blank)	
	GL024	Art paste (for paper mache)	CASCADE	29	1.98	\$ 57.42
	GL025	Glue Gun	NASCO	0	2.28	\$ -
		Plaid Mod Podge	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	5	18.36	\$ 91.80
	GL026	Elmers Glue-All	CASCADE	30	9.08	\$ 272.40
		Low temp glue sticks	CASCADE	0	3.53	\$ -
	GL027	3m scotchc magic transparent tape	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	45	1.16	\$ 52.20
		Elmers Glue-All	CASCADE	152	0.79	\$ 120.08
	GL028	3M #811 Magic Plus removalbe transparent tape	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	10	1.77	\$ 17.70
		Gorilla Epoxy	NO BID	11	(blank)	
	GL029	School Smart Art Paste	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	34	0.71	\$ 24.14
	GL030	UHU Stic Clear Glue Sticks	CASCADE	196	0.21	\$ 41.16
GL031	UHU stic Glue Sticks	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	276	0.94	\$ 259.44	
GL032	BLACK GLUE	KURTZ BROTHERS	24	2.07	\$ 49.68	
GL033	LOCKTITE OR SUPER GLUE GEL	NASCO	12	2.77	\$ 33.24	
GL034	Large Glue Sticks	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	300	0.19	\$ 57.00	
PAINTS	PS001	TEMPERA CAKES WHITE	NASCO	124	0.51	\$ 63.24
	PS002	TEMPERA CAKES BLACK	NASCO	124	0.51	\$ 63.24
	PS003	TEMPERA CAKES RED	NASCO	124	0.51	\$ 63.24
	PS004	TEMPERA CAKES YELLOW	NASCO	124	0.51	\$ 63.24
	PS005	TEMPERA CAKES ORANGE	NASCO	96	0.51	\$ 48.96
	PS006	TEMPERA CAKES BLUE	NASCO	124	0.51	\$ 63.24
	PS007	TEMPERA CAKES PURPLE	NASCO	96	0.51	\$ 48.96
	PS008	TEMPERA CAKES GREEN	NASCO	108	0.51	\$ 55.08
	PS009	TEMPERA CAKES BROWN	NASCO	108	0.51	\$ 55.08
	PS010	TEMPERA CAKE 8-WELL TRAY	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	50	0.98	\$ 49.00
	PS011	Jack Richardson floures tempr cakes	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	18	7.37	\$ 132.66
	PS012	Metalic Tempra Cakes	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	24	7.09	\$ 170.16

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PAINTS	PS013	Jack Richardson 9 set tempra cakes	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	30	3.93	\$ 117.90
	PS014	BLACK	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	12	4.04	\$ 48.48
	PS015	BLUE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	4.04	\$ 28.28
	PS016	BROWN	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	4.04	\$ 20.20
	PS017	EMERALD GREEN	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	4.04	\$ 20.20
	PS018	GREEN	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	4.04	\$ 20.20
	PS019	MAGENTA	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	4.04	\$ 28.28
	PS020	ORANGE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	4.04	\$ 28.28
	PS021	RED	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	4.04	\$ 28.28
	PS022	TURQUOISE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	4.04	\$ 20.20
	PS023	VIOLET	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	4.04	\$ 28.28
	PS024	WHITE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	13	4.04	\$ 52.52
	PS025	YELLOW	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	13	4.04	\$ 52.52
	PS026	YELLOW-GREEN	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	4.04	\$ 4.04
	PS027	BLUE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	12.76	\$ 76.56
	PS028	BROWN	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	12.76	\$ 51.04
	PS029	BURNT SIENNA	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	12.76	\$ 63.80
	PS030	GREEN	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	12.76	\$ 51.04
	PS031	MAGENTA	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	12.76	\$ 51.04
	PS032	ORANGE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	12.76	\$ 63.80
	PS033	PEACH	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	12.76	\$ 63.80
	PS034	RED	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	12.76	\$ 76.56
	PS035	TURQUOISE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	12.76	\$ 63.80
	PS036	VIOLET	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	12.76	\$ 63.80
	PS037	WHITE	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	10	12.76	\$ 127.60
	PS038	YELLOW	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	12.76	\$ 89.32
	PS039	BLACK	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	12.76	\$ 76.56
	PS040	RED	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	14	2.37	\$ 33.18
	PS041	YELLOW	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	19	2.37	\$ 45.03
	PS042	ORANGE	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS043	BLUE	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	14	2.37	\$ 33.18
	PS044	GREEN	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS045	BROWN	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	0	2.37	\$ -
	PS046	VIOLET	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS047	WHITE	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	1	2.37	\$ 2.37
	PS048	MAGENTA	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS049	TURQUOISE	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS050	Red-orange	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	0	2.37	\$ -
	PS051	Yellow-orange	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS052	Blue-green	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	0	2.37	\$ -
	PS053	BLACK	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	2	2.37	\$ 4.74
	PS054	YELLOW-GREEN	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	0	2.37	\$ -
	PS055	Blue-violet	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	1	2.37	\$ 2.37
	PS056	Red-violet	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	1	2.37	\$ 2.37

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PAINTS	PS057	Watercolor set; 12 half pans: permanent red light, madder lake deep, permanent lemon yellow, azo yellow medium, yellow ochre, cobalt blue, ultramarine deep, permanent green, viridian, payne's gray, burnt sienna and Chinese white. Include size 4 nylon pointed round pocket brush	NO BID	50	(blank)	
	PS058	Bright red	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	5.12	\$ 35.84
	PS059	Chrome yellow	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	9	5.12	\$ 46.08
	PS060	Cobalt blue	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	8	5.12	\$ 40.96
	PS061	Green oxide	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	8	5.12	\$ 40.96
	PS062	MAGENTA	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	5.12	\$ 30.72
	PS063	Mars black	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	13	5.12	\$ 66.56
	PS064	Metallic silver	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	13	5.12	\$ 66.56
	PS065	Metallic Gold	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	13	5.12	\$ 66.56
	PS066	Titanium white	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	14	5.12	\$ 71.68
	PS067	Ultramarine blue	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	5.12	\$ 25.60
	PS068	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	7	14.81	\$ 103.67
	PS069	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	14.7	\$ 73.50
	PS070	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	14.34	\$ 71.70
	PS071	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	13.68	\$ 82.08
	PS072	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	14.94	\$ 74.70
	PS073	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	19.03	\$ 76.12
	PS074	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	18.64	\$ 74.56
	PS075	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	3	13.89	\$ 41.67
	PS076	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	4	16.35	\$ 65.40
	PS077	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	2	14.55	\$ 29.10
	PS078	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	5	35.64	\$ 178.20
	PS079	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	2	35.64	\$ 71.28
	PS080	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	7.36	\$ -
	PS081	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	7.31	\$ -
	PS082	Studio Series Acrylic Paint	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	8.83	\$ -
	PS083	Studio Gesso, Gallon	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	23.05	\$ 138.30
	PS084	Gloss Medium, 32 oz	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	30	13.16	\$ 394.80
	PS085	Matte Medium, 32 oz	CASCADE	11	4.05	\$ 44.55
	PS086	Utrecht Watercolor Masking Fluid	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	5.18	\$ -
	PS087	Cotton Canvas Pads, 9"x12"	CASCADE	12	3.11	\$ 37.32
	PS088	Cotton Canvas Pads, 18"x24"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	13	14.14	\$ 183.82
	PS089	Studio Canvas, 16"x20"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	40	9.83	\$ 393.20
PS090	Liquid watercolors	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	6	19.88	\$ 119.28	
PS091	Adult Apron	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	3	5.8	\$ 17.40	
PS092	Waterless Cleaner (Smooth)	NASCO	2	20.76	\$ 41.52	
PS093	Waterless Cleaner (Pumice)	NASCO	2	20.76	\$ 41.52	
PS094	Folding palette box	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	1.78	\$ -	
PS095	Art Utility Cups 3-1/4 oz with lids pkg. of 25	NASCO	24	2.3	\$ 55.20	
PS096	DISPOSABLE CONTAINERS	S&S WORLDWIDE	25	2.22	\$ 55.50	
PS097	DISPOSABLE PALETTE PAD	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	25	3.68	\$ 92.00	
PS098	16-color crayola watercolor set	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	196	4.8	\$ 940.80	
PS099	4 oz. 10 tube set acrylics	NASCO	15	27.38	\$ 410.70	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PAINTS	PS100	Empty Well Pan	NASCO	28	1.09	\$ 30.52
	PS101	PREMIUM GRADE TEMPERA	CASCADE	12	4.48	\$ 53.76
	PS102	PREMIUM GRADE WATERCOLOR	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	78	1.5	\$ 117.00
	PS103	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	12	2.37	\$ 28.44
	PS104	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS105	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	10	2.37	\$ 23.70
	PS106	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS107	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS108	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS109	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS110	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS111	PRANG Watercolor Oval Pan Refills	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	6	2.37	\$ 14.22
	PS112	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS113	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS114	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS115	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	6	4.25	\$ 25.50
	PS116	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS117	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS118	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS119	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
	PS120	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00
PS121	CRAYOLA PREMIER TEMPERA - PINT	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	12	4.25	\$ 51.00	
PAPER AND PORTFOLIOS	PP001	60 pound 9 x 12 paper	NASCO	1	2.47	\$ 2.47
	PP002	Fadeless art paper 12"x18"	S&S WORLDWIDE	12	3.86	\$ 46.32
	PP003	Fadeless 2-Color Duet Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	17	2.93	\$ 49.81
	PP004	Craft paper, 36" roll	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	25.81	\$ 154.86
	PP005	Watercolor paper 15" x 22"	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	416	0.2	\$ 83.20
	PP006	80# White Sulphite Drawing Paper 9"x12"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	47	5.65	\$ 265.55
	PP007	80# White Sulphite Drawing Paper 12"x18"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	37	11.33	\$ 419.21
	PP008	90# white sulphite drawing paper 18 x 24"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	24	33.7	\$ 808.80
	PP009	Masa paper	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	0	0.9	\$ -
	PP010	Tracing Paper 9"X12"	CASCADE	9	1.15	\$ 10.35
	PP011	Strathmore 300 Series Tracing Paper (9"x12")	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	25	2.28	\$ 57.00
	PP012	Origami paper 4 5/8"x4 5/8"	NASCO	24	1.51	\$ 36.24
	PP013	5 7/8" origami paper assorted	NASCO	6	2.8	\$ 16.80
	PP014	4 5/8" origami paper assorted	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	10.14	\$ 40.56
	PP015	Origami paper assortment	NO BID	8	(blank)	
	PP016	Pacon paper squares origami paper	KURTZ BROTHERS	9	4.72	\$ 42.48
	PP017	Nature Print Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	2	5.77	\$ 11.54
	PP018	Colored tissue assortment	CASCADE	3	19.91	\$ 59.73
	PP019	Multicolor Scratch art paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	13.78	\$ 55.12
	PP020	Black Scratch art paper	NASCO	6	3.12	\$ 18.72
	PP021	Black with gold underscratch scratchboard	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	18.74	\$ 74.96
	PP022	Multicolor Scratch art paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	13.78	\$ 55.12
	PP023	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	85	1.91	\$ 162.35

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PAPER AND	PP024	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	17	2.27	\$ 38.59
	PP025	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	2.37	\$ 23.70
	PP026	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	43	1.91	\$ 82.13
	PP027	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	25	1.98	\$ 49.50
	PP028	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	45	2.02	\$ 90.90
	PP029	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	31	1.97	\$ 61.07
	PP030	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	43	1.91	\$ 82.13
	PP031	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	28	2.27	\$ 63.56
	PP032	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	12	1.97	\$ 23.64
	PP033	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	19	2.01	\$ 38.19
	PP034	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	19	1.98	\$ 37.62
	PP035	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	40	1.91	\$ 76.40
	PP036	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	18	2.41	\$ 43.38
	PP037	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	20	1.91	\$ 38.20
	PP038	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	23	1.98	\$ 45.54
	PP039	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	2.27	\$ 22.70
	PP040	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	39	1.98	\$ 77.22
	PP041	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	16	2.4	\$ 38.40
	PP042	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	5.77	\$ 34.62
	PP043	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	5.24	\$ 52.40
	PP044	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	9	5.24	\$ 47.16
	PP045	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	10	4.82	\$ 48.20
	PP046	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	14	5.77	\$ 80.78
	PP047	Construction Paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	45	4.21	\$ 189.45
	PP048	CONSTRUCTION PAPER - ASSORT COLORS	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	3.74	\$ 22.44
	PP049	Canson Foundation Tracing Paper Pad	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	13	2.32	\$ 30.16
	PP050	Canson Foundation Bristol Pad	NASCO	33	5.36	\$ 176.88
	PP051	Spectra Deluxe Bleeding Art Tissue	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	1.79	\$ 10.74
	PP052	Spectra Deluxe Bleeding Art Tissue	S&S WORLDWIDE	6	2.99	\$ 17.94
	PP053	Hygloss Metallic Foil Pack	NASCO	6	3.01	\$ 18.06
	PP054	Strathmore Gemini Watercolor Paper	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	12	3.69	\$ 44.28
	PP055	Strathmore Imperial 500 Series Watercolor Paper	NASCO	12	3.11	\$ 37.32
	PP056	Hole Punched Paper	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	40	5.35	\$ 214.00
	PP057	Drawing Paper	CASCADE	21	23.67	\$ 497.07
	PP058	Multicultural construction paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	3	1.1	\$ 3.30
	PP059	Multicultural construction paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	1.82	\$ 10.92
	PP060	12 x 18" newsprint - 500 sheets	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	12	4.09	\$ 49.08
	PP062	18 x 24" newsprint - 500 sheets	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	8.13	\$ 32.52
	PP063	12 x 18" manila tagboard	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	11	4.27	\$ 46.97
	PP064	White sulphite drawing paper	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	10.29	\$ -
	PP065	Sandpaper - medium, 9 x 11" 10 sheets	CASCADE	4	5.43	\$ 21.72
PP066	Assorted sandpaper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	9.78	\$ 68.46	
PP067	Crescent off white matboard	NO BID	86	(blank)		
PP068	Peacock Railroad Board, 4 ply (Black)	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	0.22	\$ -	
PP069	Peacock Railroad Board, 6 ply (White)	KURTZ BROTHERS	5	0.22	\$ 1.10	
PP070	Peacock Railroad Board, 4 ply (Lemon yellow)	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	0.22	\$ -	
PP071	Peacock Railroad Board, 4 ply (Light Green)	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	0.22	\$ -	

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PAPER AND	PP072	Peacock Railroad Board, 4 ply (Red)	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	0.22	\$ -
	PP073	white 2-ply tag board (24"X36")	CASCADE	0	18.15	\$ -
	PP074	All purpose chipboard single thick	CASCADE	104	5.83	\$ 606.32
	PP075	Blick B10609-2013 Tracing paper	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	2	1.88	\$ 3.76
	PP076	Economy watercolor paper	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	14	35	\$ 490.00
	PP077	White Tag Board Heavy Weight 36" x 24"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	31	18.07	\$ 560.17
	PP078	White tag board heavy weight	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	22	2.37	\$ 52.14
	PP079	Portfolios, 10"X15"	CASCADE	200	0.66	\$ 132.00
	PP080	Gray paper stumps (set of 12)	NO BID	38	(blank)	
	PP081	12" x 18" manila paper	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	6.74	\$ 26.96
	PP082	Gray Rives BFK	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	20	3.88	\$ 77.60
	PP083	Tan Rives BFK	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	24	3.88	\$ 93.12
	PP084	White Rives heavyweight	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	44	2.09	\$ 91.96
	PP085	Oak tag	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	551	17.29	\$ 9,526.79
	PP086	Mat Board White Pebbled #335, 30 x 40 "	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PP087	Crescent white mat board	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PP088	White tag board heavy weight 12" x 18"	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	13	4.31	\$ 56.03
	PP089	Scratch art wodden stylus	S&S WORLDWIDE	9	1.39	\$ 12.51
	PP090	50 white matt frames	NASCO	1	14.58	\$ 14.58
	PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES	PH001	Sprint Stop Bath Block solution, 4 liter	B & H PHOTO	20	23.95
PH002		Sprint Quick Silver, Print Developer, 4 liter	NO BID	20	(blank)	
PH003		Sprint Record Speed Fixer solution, 4 liter	B & H PHOTO	20	38.85	\$ 777.00
PH004		Heico, Permawash, 32 oz.	B & H PHOTO	2	16.65	\$ 33.30
PH005		Kodak, T-Max Developer, 1 L/ 33.8 oz	NO BID	60	(blank)	
PH006		Kodak, Rapid Fixer, 1 gallon	NO BID	20	(blank)	
PH007		Kodak Indicator Stop Bath, 1 gallon	NO BID	2	(blank)	
PH008		"Bienfang", ColorMount tissue	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	10	30.75	\$ 307.50
PH009		Iford brand, HP5+ film, 135-24	B & H PHOTO	140	3.99	\$ 558.60
PH010		Eiko, enlarger lamp, 75 W, 2900-K	B & H PHOTO	12	2.75	\$ 33.00
PH011		Clear-File, Archival Plus, Negative File Strips	B & H PHOTO	16	20.95	\$ 335.20
PH012		Nikon FM-10 kit, with 35-70 lens	B & H PHOTO	2	499.9	\$ 999.80
PH013		Iford, Deluxe RC Photo paper, 8 x 10, 25 pack	B & H PHOTO	12	17.85	\$ 214.20
PH014		Iford, Deluxe RC Photo paper, 5 x 7, 250 pack	B & H PHOTO	14	69.35	\$ 970.90
PH015		Iford, Deluxe RC Photo paper, 8 x 10, 250 pack	B & H PHOTO	12	138.25	\$ 1,659.00
PH016		Iford, Deluxe RC Photo paper, 8 x 10, 100 pack	B & H PHOTO	12	67.35	\$ 808.20
PH017		Iford, Fiber base, Matt Photo Pater, 8 x 10, 25 pk	B & H PHOTO	12	26.7	\$ 320.40
PH018		Iford, Deluxe RC Photo paper, 11 x 14, 50 pack	B & H PHOTO	3	67	\$ 201.00
PH019		Berg brand, Toner, 1 quart, RC Sepia	B & H PHOTO	16	9.9	\$ 158.40

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES	PH020	Berg brand, Toner, 1 quart, RC Copper, brown	B & H PHOTO	16	9.9	\$ 158.40
	PH021	Berg brand, Toner, 1 quart, RC Brilliant Blue	B & H PHOTO	16	9.9	\$ 158.40
	PH022	Kodak, Toner, Sepia II, warm, 1 qt.	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PH023	Kodak, Photo Flo 200 Solution	NO BID	3	(blank)	
	PH024	SR44 batteries, silver button, 1.5 volt	B & H PHOTO	60	1.95	\$ 117.00
	PH025	Varta AA batteries	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	24	0.5	\$ 12.00
	PH026	CR123a lithium batteries	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	36	1.95	\$ 70.20
	PH027	s76	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	40	1.46	\$ 58.40
	PH028	v625u batteries	NO BID	24	(blank)	
	PH029	Cap keeper, interchangeable	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	24	1.1	\$ 26.40
	PH030	Tiffen, 58 mm lens cap	B & H PHOTO	8	2.92	\$ 23.36
	PH031	Tiffen, 52 mm lens cap	B & H PHOTO	8	3.16	\$ 25.28
	PH032	Tiffen, 49 mm lens cap	B & H PHOTO	8	3.16	\$ 25.28
	PH033	Tiffen, 62 mm lens cap	B & H PHOTO	2	3.16	\$ 6.32
	PH034	Micro Sight Grain Focuser, 25 x	B & H PHOTO	4	48.95	\$ 195.80
	PH035	Arista, Bamboo Print Tongs	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	12	5.4	\$ 64.80
	PH036	Film Cartridge Opener	B & H PHOTO	4	9.95	\$ 39.80
	PH037	Delta, Glow Tape, 1" by 5 yards	B & H PHOTO	4	13.95	\$ 55.80
	PH038	PEC-12 film cleaner, 4 oz	NO BID	12	(blank)	
	PH039	Photofinish soft	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	4	18.95	\$ 75.80
	PH040	Ilford, Multigrade Filter Set, 6 x 6	B & H PHOTO	6	40.45	\$ 242.70
	PH041	Cable release	B & H PHOTO	6	14.25	\$ 85.50
	PH042	Red 25 filter	B & H PHOTO	4	57	\$ 228.00
	PH043	55-58 step up ring	B & H PHOTO	2	3.19	\$ 6.38
	PH044	Close-up set, (+1, +2, +4)	B & H PHOTO	4	54.99	\$ 219.96
	PH045	52-58 step up ring	B & H PHOTO	2	3.19	\$ 6.38
	PH046	Step-down ring 62-58	B & H PHOTO	2	3.6	\$ 7.20
	PH047	Spotting brushes, size 000	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	18	6.5	\$ 117.00
	PH048	liquid light vc emulsion	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PH049	Marshall's Extender	NO BID	4	(blank)	
	PH050	Arista, economy easel	B & H PHOTO	2	34.75	\$ 69.50
	PH051	Labcoat	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	2	47.5	\$ 95.00
	PH052	Ilford, SFX 200 film	B & H PHOTO	12	7.94	\$ 95.28
	PH053	Time-o-Lite timers, M-72R	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	2	136	\$ 272.00
	PH054	Fuji, FP-100C ISO 100 3.25 x 4.25"	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PH055	Marshall's Photo Oil Hobby Set, 15 colors	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	2	43.65	\$ 87.30
PH056	Peerless B & W Dry Spotting Dyes Student Kit	B & H PHOTO	4	8.85	\$ 35.40	
PH057	Patterson Extra Reel, plastic	NO BID	8	(blank)		
PH058	Printfile Custom Proofer	NO BID	4	(blank)		
PH059	Blotting Book, 12 x 15 "	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	4	26.85	\$ 107.40	
PH060	Photo Marker Set, Natural Hues	NO BID	0	(blank)		
PH061	Bienfang colormount 11" x 14"	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	4	64	\$ 256.00	
PH062	Tiffen, 55 mm lens cap	B & H PHOTO	2	3.96	\$ 7.92	
PH063	Step-down ring 77-72	B & H PHOTO	2	4.68	\$ 9.36	
PH064	Step-down ring 72-67	B & H PHOTO	2	5.2	\$ 10.40	
PH065	Step-down ring 67-62	B & H PHOTO	2	3.6	\$ 7.20	
PH066	Edwal Anti-Stat Film Cleaner 32 Oz.	NO BID	2	(blank)		

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PHOTOGRAPHY	PH067	6V 160MAH LITHIUM battery	B & H PHOTO	8	5.75	\$ 46.00
	PH068	Ph111A Enlarger Lamp 75W 125v	B & H PHOTO	8	6.85	\$ 54.80
	PH069	Edwal No Scratch, 1 oz.	NO BID	6	(blank)	
	PH070	Ilford Delta Pro 400 iso 120 film	B & H PHOTO	12	4.85	\$ 58.20
	PH071	General Brand 2CR5 6v Lithium Battery	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	12	3.35	\$ 40.20
	PH072	Film-Vue Archival 120 film sleeves	B & H PHOTO	1	17.95	\$ 17.95
	PH073	Adorama 20" cable release with screw lock	B & H PHOTO	12	14.25	\$ 171.00
	PH074	Canon deluxe tripod 300 with carry case	B & H PHOTO	8	36.99	\$ 295.92
	PH075	Ilford multigrade IV RC portfolio postcard B & W paper, pearl finish	B & H PHOTO	4	33.65	\$ 134.60
	PH076	Sekonic L-208 Twinmate analog light meter	B & H PHOTO	0	109.95	\$ -
	PH077	Spot pen	B & H PHOTO	4	6.95	\$ 27.80
	PH078	Patrson multi-reel 3 tank only (super system 4) for film developing	NO BID	2	(blank)	
	PH079	General Brand CR2 3v Lithium Battery	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	12	1.95	\$ 23.40
	PH080	Fujifilm Instax Mini Picture Instant Film(20 Shots)	B & H PHOTO	16	14.5	\$ 232.00
	PH081	Paterson Changing Bag (27.5 x 27.5")	B & H PHOTO	0	24.95	\$ -
	PH082	Edwal Hypo Check (Liquid) - 4 Oz.	B & H PHOTO	2	19.4	\$ 38.80
	PH083	Pec Pad, 4 x 4 inch sheets, 100 pack	B & H PHOTO	12	7.95	\$ 95.40
	PH084	Xyron 250 CREATE A STICKER REPOSITIONL refill	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	4	24.5	\$ 98.00
	PH085	Color Duck Tape White	CASCADE	10	3.11	\$ 31.10
	PH086	Crescent RagMat Matboard	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	50	27.5	\$ 1,375.00
	PH087	AC Cardstock Paper Packs	VALLEY LITHO SUPPLY	1	19.95	\$ 19.95
	PH093	Gagne Porta-Trace LED Light Boxes	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	(blank)	35.66	\$ -
	PH088	AC Cardstock Paper Packs	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	11.66	\$ 11.66
	PH089	Canon EF 50mm f/2.5 Compact Macro Lens	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PH090	Epson Ultra Premium Luster Photo Paper	B & H PHOTO	2	77.5	\$ 155.00
	PH091	Canon EOS Rebel T5 DSLR Camera	B & H PHOTO	14	477.9	\$ 6,690.60
	PH092	Sensei Step-Down Ring Kit (77-52)	B & H PHOTO	2	15.5	\$ 31.00
	PH094	SanDisk 16GB Ultra-SanDisk 16 GB Ultra UHS-I SDHIC Memory Card	B & H PHOTO	(blank)	8.2	\$ -
PRINTMAKING	PR001	2" soft brayer	CASCADE	(blank)	3.35	\$ -
	PR002	4" soft brayer	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	46	7.58	\$ 348.68
	PR003	Baren	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	8	11.16	\$ 89.28
	PR004	12"x18" printfoam for printing	NASCO	6	7	\$ 42.00
	PR005	Print Foam/48 per pack	NASCO	5	10.47	\$ 52.35
	PR006	Printing blocks 12 x 18"	NASCO	0	7.64	\$ -
	PR007	EZ Cut (4"x6")	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	168	1	\$ 168.00
	PR008	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Lt. Red	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	27	4.5	\$ 121.50
	PR009	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, White	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	32	4.5	\$ 144.00
	PR010	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Dk Yellow	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	25	4.5	\$ 112.50
	PR011	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Orange	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	24	4.5	\$ 108.00

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE
PRINTMAKING	PR012	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Black	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	28	4.5	\$ 126.00
	PR013	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Green	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	26	4.5	\$ 117.00
	PR014	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Blue	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	28	4.5	\$ 126.00
	PR015	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Brown	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	14	4.5	\$ 63.00
	PR016	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Silver	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	14	4.5	\$ 63.00
	PR017	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Turquoise	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	22	4.5	\$ 99.00
	PR018	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Magenta	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	16	4.5	\$ 72.00
	PR019	9"x7" bench hook	CASCADE	30	3.6	\$ 108.00
	PR020	Leaf print set	BLICK ART MATERIALS LLC	1	20.3	\$ 20.30
	PR021	Scratch-Art scratch knife	NASCO	0	4.18	\$ -
	PR022	Blick low cost ready mats	NASCO	0	14.58	\$ -
	PR023	Foam brayer	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	8	2.83	\$ 22.64
	PR034	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Assorted	NASCO	1	3.82	\$ 3.82
	PR035	Water Soluble Block Printing Ink, Primary Yellow	NASCO	0	3.82	\$ -
	PR036	Water Soluble Block Printing ink, Primary Blue	NASCO	0	3.82	\$ -
	PR037	Water Soluble Block Printing ink, Primary Red	NASCO	0	3.82	\$ -
	PR038	Akua Kolor Ink Sets 11 color Soy based Ink	NO BID	4	(blank)	
	PR039	Akua Kolor Ink Sets 11 color Soy based Ink	NO BID	11	(blank)	
	PR040	Akua Color Intaglio inks in black, blue, white and yellow	NASCO	0	9.28	\$ -
	PR041	Akua Color Intaglio inks in black, blue, white and yellow	NO BID	0	(blank)	
	PR042	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	13	4.5	\$ 58.50
	PR043	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR044	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR045	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR046	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR047	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR048	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	4.5	\$ 27.00
	PR049	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	6	4.5	\$ 27.00
	PR050	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR051	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	13	4.5	\$ 58.50
	PR052	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	7	4.5	\$ 31.50
	PR053	Speedball Block Printing Ink	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	4	4.5	\$ 18.00
	SCISSORS & BLADES	SC001	#1 knife	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	20	0.47
SC002		#2 knife	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	1.28	\$ -
SC003		#2 knife blades bulk pack 100 blades	NASCO	1	15.38	\$ 15.38
SC004		Speedball Lino Set #1	KURTZ BROTHERS	63	4.69	\$ 295.47
SC005		Speedball Linoleum Cutters	NASCO	0	9.6	\$ -
SC006		Speedball Linoleum Cutters	NASCO	0	9.6	\$ -
SC007		Student scissors	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	37	0.8	\$ 29.60

LEXINGTON PUBLIC SCHOOLS 2016-2017 ART, CLASSROOM PHOTOGRAPHY SUPPLIES BID
 AWARD BY ITEM #

CATEGORY	LPS	DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	EST QTY.	PRICE/UNIT2	Sum of AWARD VALUE	
SCISSORS & BLADES	SC008	Student scissors - middle schoolers - Armada Precision classroom scissors	NASCO	5	1.04	\$ 5.20	
	SC009	Adult scissors, lefty	CASCADE	3	7.07	\$ 21.21	
	SC010	Adult scissors, righty	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	33	1.64	\$ 54.12	
	SC011	Boston Bulldog Clips (1")	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	10	1.52	\$ 15.20	
	SC012	Paper Shapers (Set B)	KURTZ BROTHERS	3	17.44	\$ 52.32	
	SC013	Premier Heavy Duty trimmer 24" cut	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	94.99	\$ -	
	SC014	X-acto #1 knife	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	162	1.65	\$ 267.30	
	SC015	X-acto #11 blades	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	98	1.31	\$ 128.38	
	SC016	Scissors -black handles	STANDARD STATIONERY SUPPLY	2	2.45	\$ 4.90	
	SC017	SCISSORS BLACK HANDLES	CASCADE	12	2.4	\$ 28.80	
	SC018	FISKARS NO 7 UTILITY CUTTER	NASCO	10	7.11	\$ 71.10	
	SC019	ALVIN PREM UTILITY KNIFE	NASCO	6	3.98	\$ 23.88	
	SC020	OCM DESKTOP STACK PAPER CUTTER	NASCO	1	435.52	\$ 435.52	
	SC021	SAW BLADES,JEWELERS BUDGET,2,GROSS	CASCADE	(blank)	1.46	\$ -	
	SC022	High-Speed Steel Twist Drill, #53 1.51mm	NO BID	0	(blank)		
	SC023	Fiskars Craft Drill	NASCO	0	8.63	\$ -	
	SC024	Speedball Linoleum Cutters x 20 #40203	NASCO	0	9.6	\$ -	
	SC025	Fiskars Soft Grip 7" scissors	CASCADE	0	2.59	\$ -	
	SC026	Beadalon Memory Wire Shear	NO BID	5	(blank)		
	SCULPTURE SUPPLIES	SC001	Medium modeling clay	NASCO	0	8.6	\$ -
		SC002	Styrofoam sculpture head	NASCO	7	33.23	\$ 232.61
SC003		SWISS Pattern Needle Files set of 12	NASCO	0	6.53	\$ -	
SC004		Creative Paperclay	NASCO	16	6.25	\$ 100.00	
SC005		Solid Maple Rolling pin	KURTZ BROTHERS	0	4.43	\$ -	
SC006		Kemper Cut -Off Needle Hvy Dty	NASCO	0	0.79	\$ -	
SC007		No. 1 Ribbon Tool	NASCO	0	2.39	\$ -	
SC008		CrayolaTempera	CASCADE	0	4.48	\$ -	
SC009		SKUTT Posts and shelves - octagon 1/2	NO BID	0	(blank)		
SC010		Createx Cryllic Colors	NO BID	0	(blank)		
Grand Total						\$ 163,719.66	